
Deliverance Prayer
Heavenly Father, I come to you now in the name of Jesus the Christ, the name 
above all names, to repent of all the sins in my life and the life of my ancestors 
that may have resulted in a curse upon me. I repent of all disobedience, rebellion, 
mistreatment of others, lying, cheating, using or slandering your name in vain. I 
turn from and repent of all perversion, lust, incest, fornication, adultery, idolatry, 
witchcraft, murder, and any form of occult involvement.

Heavenly Father, I ask for your forgiveness and for cleansing through the blood 
of Jesus the Christ. Lord Jesus, I now take the authority you have given me and 
command all evil and demonic spirits of anger, rage, fear, depression, destruction, 
torment,  guilt,  bondage,  wandering  irresponsibility,  rejection,  unforgiveness, 
bitterness,  mind-control,  double-mindedness,  psychic  activity,  confusion, 
passivity, sicknesses, diseases, and pains to come out of every part of me in the 
name of Jesus the Christ.

In the name of Jesus the Christ I command any addictions that I have to food,  
alcohol, drugs, sex, pornography, masturbation, gambling, and nicotine to come 
out of me and never to return. No demonic spirit is welcome in or has any legal 
right to any part of my body, soul, mind, or spirit. My body has been made holy by 
the blood of Jesus, in the name of Jesus, and by the Holy Spirit, who lives in me.  I 
break all spoken curses and spells that may have been spoken or performed over 
my life,  and any curses  resulting from involvement  with psychics,  tarot  cards, 
horoscopes,  evil  music,  or  through  evil  I  have  seen  on  TV,  in  movies, 
pornography, and associations with  people who are possessed by evil intentions. I 
repent of any involvement with Freemasonry and its associated organizations and 
entities. On behalf of my ancestors and myself, I confess such involvement as sin. 
In the name of Jesus Christ, I break all spoken curses off my family, marriage, 
children, and relatives.  I  break every shackle,  chain, rope, cord, habit,  craving, 
desire, debt, soul-ties and any spirit that has tried to rob, kill, or destroy a part of 
my life. In the name of Jesus Christ, I command that my family be set free. I break 
every demonic assignment and every evil influence linked to my family. In the 
name of Jesus, I command the devil and all his demons to loose them now and 
return to the pit until you return to hell from whence you came.



According to Galatians 3:13, Jesus Christ has redeemed us from the curse of the 
Law. (See Deuteronomy 28:1-14.) Jesus Christ is the way, the truth, and the  life. 
Through my Lord Jesus, I cast down all demonic powers and spirits that come 
against me or that operate in my family’s lives.

I confess with my mouth that I am not cursed, but blessed. I am blessed coming in 
and going out. I am above and not beneath. I am the head and not the tail. I am the 
healed and not the sick. I am blessed and highly favored and what God has blessed 
cannot be cursed. I am free and I am saved. I am a victor, not a victim. I have now 
exercised  my faith  and know that  according  to  Romans  10:9-10 confession  is 
made unto salvation. All my sins have been forgiven and remitted. I am released 
from the guilt and penalty of sin. I am released from all curses that came as a  
result of my disobedience and rebellion to the Word and will of God. Thank you, 
heavenly Father, for forgiving me and setting me free from every curse and evil 
spirit that has operated in my life. Father God, I confess that you have given me 
the ability to recognize, resist,  and defeat all  fleshly and worldly ways. I have 
received anointing by your Holy Spirit and authority over how I live my life from 
the Lord Jesus Christ. I thank you, Jesus, for your guidance and for giving me self-
control  that  comes  from  your  Holy  Spirit  who  lives  within  me.  I  speak  the 
protective blood of Jesus the Christ over me, my family, my home, my activities, 
my ministry of helping others, my work, my health, my attitudes, my finances, and 
every other part of my daily life. Heavenly Father, I thank you for my body that 
has been made in your image and after your likeness. By a decision of my will and 
commitment of my faith, I want to have an extended life on Earth and, therefore, I 
turn my body over to you, Lord God.

Dear Lord, I place it on your altar and ask you to take care of it, preserve it, and 
protect it. From now on my body belongs entirely to you. Therefore, I will listen 
and be obedient to you with my new eating life-style, as you deliver me from my 
previous unhealthy eating habits. I thank you that because of you, I will achieve 
my desired weight and maintain it. Hallelujah. Amen.


